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Generations of students have been taught that the American Revolution was a revolt against royal tyranny. In
this revisionist account, Eric Nelson argues that a great many of our “founding fathers” saw themselves as
rebels against the British Parliament, not the Crown. The Royalist Revolution interprets the patriot campaign
of the 1770s as an insurrection in favor of royal power?driven by the conviction that the Lords and
Commons had usurped the just prerogatives of the monarch.

Leading patriots believed that the colonies were the king’s own to govern, and they urged George III to defy
Parliament and rule directly. These theorists were proposing to turn back the clock on the English
constitution, rejecting the Whig settlement that had secured the supremacy of Parliament after the Glorious
Revolution. Instead, they embraced the political theory of those who had waged the last great campaign
against Parliament’s “usurpations”: the reviled Stuart monarchs of the seventeenth century.

When it came time to design the state and federal constitutions, the very same figures who had defended this
expansive conception of royal authority?John Adams, Alexander Hamilton, James Wilson, and their
allies?returned to the fray as champions of a single executive vested with sweeping prerogatives. As a result
of their labors, the Constitution of 1787 would assign its new president far more power than any British
monarch had wielded for almost a hundred years. On one side of the Atlantic, Nelson concludes, there would
be kings without monarchy; on the other, monarchy without kings.
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From reader reviews:

Willie Collier:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the publication entitled The Royalist Revolution: Monarchy and the American Founding. Try
to the actual book The Royalist Revolution: Monarchy and the American Founding as your pal. It means that
it can being your friend when you experience alone and beside that course make you smarter than before.
Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you far more confidence because you can know
everything by the book. So , let us make new experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

Chad West:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yep, you can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare
time to take a stroll, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book called The
Royalist Revolution: Monarchy and the American Founding? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You
already know beside you can spend your time using your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do
you agree with its opinion or you have different opinion?

Jake Harris:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to decide on book
like comic, limited story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not attempting The Royalist
Revolution: Monarchy and the American Founding that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied
simply by reading this book. Reading routine all over the world can be said as the way for people to know
world a great deal better then how they react towards the world. It can't be stated constantly that reading
addiction only for the geeky man or woman but for all of you who wants to possibly be success person. So ,
for every you who want to start examining as your good habit, you can pick The Royalist Revolution:
Monarchy and the American Founding become your own personal starter.

Beulah Scherr:

Can you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Try to
pick one book that you never know the inside because don't evaluate book by its include may doesn't work
this is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside
appearance likes. Maybe you answer is usually The Royalist Revolution: Monarchy and the American
Founding why because the great cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint anyone.
The inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will
directly show you to pick up this book.
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