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Shortly after his conversion in 1929, C. S. Lewis wrote to a friend, “When all is said (and truly said) about
the divisions of Christendom, there remains, by God’s mercy, an enormous common ground.” From that time
on, Lewis thought that the best service he could do for his unbelieving neighbors was to explain and defend
the belief that has been common to nearly all Christians at all times — that “enormous common ground”
which he usually referred to as “mere” Christianity.

Lewis’s defense of Christianity was colorfully varied — the subjects he covered ranged widely, including
Christianity and literature, Christianity and culture, ethics, futility, church music, modern theology and
biblical criticism, the Psalms, and petitionary prayer.

Presented in chronological order, some of the fourteen papers included in this collection were written
specifically for periodicals, while others, published here for the first time, were read to societies in and
around Oxford and Cambridge. Common to them all, however, are the uniquely effective style of C. S.
Lewis and the basic presuppositions of his theology — his “mere” Christianity.
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From reader reviews:

Matthew Siller:

What do you think of book? It is just for students as they are still students or the idea for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that question above. Every person has
different personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't
need do that. You must know how great and also important the book Christian Reflections. All type of book
would you see on many solutions. You can look for the internet resources or other social media.

Mildred Parker:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this Christian Reflections e-book written
by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book that may be understand by anyone who read
the book. Written in good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and writing skill only for eliminate
your current hunger then you still uncertainty Christian Reflections as good book not only by the cover but
also by the content. This is one e-book that can break don't judge book by its include, so do you still needing
another sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already said so why you have to
listening to one more sixth sense.

Nicole Rockwood:

You can spend your free time to read this book this book. This Christian Reflections is simple to create you
can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not get much space to bring
often the printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save often
the book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Clyde Okane:

You will get this Christian Reflections by check out the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it
could possibly to be your solve problem if you get difficulties on your knowledge. Kinds of this book are
various. Not only by means of written or printed but in addition can you enjoy this book by simply e-book.
In the modern era just like now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and searching what your
problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more information about your guide. It is most important to
arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.
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