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The up-to-the minute word on what's hot and what's not from "the arbiters of hip baby names."-The Wall
Street Journal

As America's leading baby-name experts, Pamela Redmond Satran and Linda Rosenkrantz hear the same
question again and again: "What are the cool names?" Here are the fun, fresh answers, delivered with the
authors' trademark wit and authority, including:

*HOT COOL--From the top 100 of cool to why Ivy is cooler than Ivana.
*COOL COOL--Famous names: movie characters, artists, athletes, musicians, and writers, even nanny diary
names
*NEW COOL--Spiritual names like Pax or Eden; color names (Indigo, Lavender); music names (Jazz,
Cadence, Madrigal); foreign word names (Luna, from the Spanish for moon; or Vero, Italian for truth).
*TOO COOL--Why not to name a child Kool or Tiger.

plus superlatives you won't find anywhere else: Coolest Cowboy Name, Coolest Southern Belle Name,
Coolest Palindrome Name, Coolest Spice Name, Coolest Hero Name...

Cool Names is the definitive guide to the hottest names.
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From reader reviews:

Susan Williams:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students because they're still students or that for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that query above. Every person
has several personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they don't
would like do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Cool Names for Babies. All type
of book are you able to see on many solutions. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Colleen Harman:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As you may know
that book is very important for all of us. The book Cool Names for Babies seemed to be making you to know
about other expertise and of course you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you. The e-
book Cool Names for Babies is not only giving you much more new information but also for being your
friend when you feel bored. You can spend your own spend time to read your publication. Try to make
relationship together with the book Cool Names for Babies. You never feel lose out for everything when you
read some books.

Nancy Maxfield:

The book Cool Names for Babies will bring someone to the new experience of reading a new book. The
author style to describe the idea is very unique. In the event you try to find new book to study, this book very
ideal to you. The book Cool Names for Babies is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-
book from your official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Lisa Phelps:

You may get this Cool Names for Babies by look at the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing
it could to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this publication are
various. Not only by written or printed but can you enjoy this book through e-book. In the modern era just
like now, you just looking from your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose
your ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your
knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose right ways for you.
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