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Williamson S. Oldham was a shrewd and candid observer of the Civil War scene. Representing the always
contrary and suspicious Texans in the Confederate Senate, he was a major opponent of President Jefferson
Davis and spoke out vehemently against conscription—which he considered an abusive violation of
individual rights—and against military interference in the cotton trade.

Oldham’s memoir provides a firsthand look at the Civil War from the perspective of a government insider. In
it, he sheds light on such topics as military strategy, foreign relations, taxes, and conflicts between state
officials and the Confederate government. Perhaps more important, his travels between Texas and
Richmond—both during and after the war—allowed him to observe the many changes taking place in the
South, and he made note of both the general sentiment of citizens and the effect of political and military
measures on the country.

Throughout the memoir, Oldham consistently stresses the centrality of politics to a society and the necessity
of legislating for the will of the people even in times of war. In assessing the Confederacy’s defeat, he points
not to military causes but to Congress’s giving in to the will of the president and military leaders rather than
ruling for and representing the people.

Clayton E. Jewett has edited and annotated Oldham’s memoir to produce the only fully edited publication of
this important document, significantly expanded here over any version previously published. His
introduction helps clarify Oldham’s position on many of the topics he discusses, making the memoir
accessible to scholar and Civil War buff alike, while his annotations reflect his deep knowledge of the
intrigue of wartime political life in both Texas and Richmond.

Oldham’s memoir offers important new insight into not only political leadership and conflicts in a young
nation but also the question of why the South lost the Civil War, dispelling many myths about the defeat and
bolstering interpretations of the Confederacy’s decline that point more to political than to military causes.
Rise and Fall of the Confederacy is one of the major political and social documents of the Confederacy and
will be a boon to all scholars of the Civil War era.
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From reader reviews:

John Valdez:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information today can get by anyone from everywhere.
The information can be a knowledge or any news even a concern. What people must be consider whenever
those information which is within the former life are challenging to be find than now could be taking
seriously which one works to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you find the
unstable resource then you buy it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen with you if you take Rise and Fall of the Confederacy: The Memoir of
Senator Williamson S. Oldham, CSA (SHADES OF BLUE & GRAY) as your daily resource information.

Ted Bryant:

The reserve untitled Rise and Fall of the Confederacy: The Memoir of Senator Williamson S. Oldham, CSA
(SHADES OF BLUE & GRAY) is the guide that recommended to you to study. You can see the quality of
the guide content that will be shown to anyone. The language that publisher use to explained their ideas are
easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot of investigation when write the book, to ensure the
information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-book of Rise and Fall of
the Confederacy: The Memoir of Senator Williamson S. Oldham, CSA (SHADES OF BLUE & GRAY)
from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Cindy Mattis:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, brief story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not hoping Rise and Fall of the Confederacy: The
Memoir of Senator Williamson S. Oldham, CSA (SHADES OF BLUE & GRAY) that give your
entertainment preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading behavior all over the world
can be said as the means for people to know world much better then how they react in the direction of the
world. It can't be said constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky individual but for all of you who
wants to become success person. So , for every you who want to start reading through as your good habit,
you could pick Rise and Fall of the Confederacy: The Memoir of Senator Williamson S. Oldham, CSA
(SHADES OF BLUE & GRAY) become your own personal starter.

Gary Lund:

Is it you actually who having spare time after that spend it whole day through watching television programs
or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Rise and Fall of the Confederacy:
The Memoir of Senator Williamson S. Oldham, CSA (SHADES OF BLUE & GRAY) can be the respond to,
oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your free time by reading in
this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?
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