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The favorite words of 250 of the best and brightest contemporary thinkers and creators are collected in this
volume that no self-respecting word lover should be without. From Secretary of State Hillary Clinton to
authors Yann Martel and Nicholson Baker, the writers, scientists, educators, humorists, and celebrities
featured in this book write at length about their favorite words and why they are so enamored with them. The
entries cover a range of responses, some witty and hilarious, some brilliant and profound, others
linguistically clever and poignant. For Mary Higgins Clark it’s memory ("the DNA of a writer"); for Arianna
Huffington, it’s trust ("both unutterably sacred and the old banana-skin joke on a cosmic scale"). Other
favorite words include the familiar (love, zest, goodness), the unfamiliar (cthonic, steatopygia, irredentist),
long words (horripilating) and short (sex), weird words (jerzoid), and refreshingly down-to-earth words
(egg). This cornucopia of words is a frequently funny, sometimes eccentric, and often surprisingly intimate
and moving look into personality and language.
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From reader reviews:

Susan Velez:

Favorite Words of Famous People: A Celebration of Superior Words from Writers, Educators, Scientists, and
Humorists can be one of your beginner books that are good idea. All of us recommend that straight away
because this guide has good vocabulary which could increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand,
bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The copy writer giving his/her effort to get every
word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Favorite Words of Famous People: A Celebration of Superior
Words from Writers, Educators, Scientists, and Humorists yet doesn't forget the main position, giving the
reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource information that maybe you can be one among it.
This great information may drawn you into new stage of crucial imagining.

David Veal:

The book untitled Favorite Words of Famous People: A Celebration of Superior Words from Writers,
Educators, Scientists, and Humorists contain a lot of information on the item. The writer explains the girl
idea with easy method. The language is very easy to understand all the people, so do not worry, you can easy
to read this. The book was compiled by famous author. The author gives you in the new time of literary
works. You can read this book because you can keep reading your smart phone, or device, so you can read
the book inside anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open up their official web-site
and also order it. Have a nice study.

Alberto Kimble:

This Favorite Words of Famous People: A Celebration of Superior Words from Writers, Educators,
Scientists, and Humorists is completely new way for you who has attention to look for some information
since it relief your hunger of information. Getting deeper you in it getting knowledge more you know
otherwise you who still having little digest in reading this Favorite Words of Famous People: A Celebration
of Superior Words from Writers, Educators, Scientists, and Humorists can be the light food for you
personally because the information inside this kind of book is easy to get by means of anyone. These books
create itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book contact form. People who
think that in e-book form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this book is the answer. So there isn't any in
reading a publication especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you
actually. So , don't miss the idea! Just read this e-book variety for your better life and knowledge.

Shirley Bishop:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book has been rare? Why so
many issue for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people likes
examining, not only science book but additionally novel and Favorite Words of Famous People: A
Celebration of Superior Words from Writers, Educators, Scientists, and Humorists as well as others sources



were given expertise for you. After you know how the truly great a book, you feel want to read more and
more. Science book was created for teacher or perhaps students especially. Those textbooks are helping them
to include their knowledge. In different case, beside science publication, any other book likes Favorite
Words of Famous People: A Celebration of Superior Words from Writers, Educators, Scientists, and
Humorists to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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