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As entertaining as it is incisive, Stoned is a raucous journey through the history of human desire for what is
rare, and therefore precious.

What makes a stone a jewel? What makes a jewel priceless? And why do we covet beautiful things? In this
brilliant account of how eight jewels shaped the course of history, jeweler and scientist Aja Raden tells an
original and often startling story about our unshakeable addiction to beauty and the darker side of human
desire.

What moves the world is what moves each of us: desire. Jewelry—which has long served as a stand-in for
wealth and power, glamor and success—has birthed cultural movements, launched political dynasties, and
started wars. Masterfully weaving together pop science and history, Stoned breaks history into three
categories—Want, Take, and Have—and explains what the diamond on your finger has to do with the GI
Bill, why green-tinted jewelry has been exalted by so many cultures, why the glass beads that bought
Manhattan for the Dutch were initially considered a fair trade, and how the French Revolution started over a
coveted necklace.

Studded with lively personalities and fascinating details, Stoned tells the remarkable story of our abiding
desire for the rare and extraordinary.
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From reader reviews:

Laurie Dunn:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive now,
people have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and
notice by surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated the idea for a while is
reading. Sure, by reading a reserve your ability to survive enhance then having chance to stay than other is
high. For you who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you that Stoned: Jewelry, Obsession, and
How Desire Shapes the World book as beginning and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is
greater than just a book.

Bill Dildy:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also be a life style. This reading addiction give you lot of
advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the book that
will improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of reserve you read, if
you want have more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want feel happy read one along
with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. Often the Stoned: Jewelry, Obsession, and How
Desire Shapes the World is kind of reserve which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Macie Tiffany:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them loved ones or
their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, as well as
playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read
the book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent 24 hours a day
to reading a e-book. The book Stoned: Jewelry, Obsession, and How Desire Shapes the World it is extremely
good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this
book. In the event you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy the particular e-book. You
can m0ore simply to read this book through your smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book has
high quality.

David Ruby:

Beside that Stoned: Jewelry, Obsession, and How Desire Shapes the World in your phone, it can give you a
way to get more close to the new knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you might got
here is fresh from your oven so don't be worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow commune. It is
good thing to have Stoned: Jewelry, Obsession, and How Desire Shapes the World because this book offers
to your account readable information. Do you often have book but you seldom get what it's exactly about. Oh
come on, that will not happen if you have this inside your hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot be
questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss the idea? Find this book and also



read it from today!
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