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This book is about a sacred place called Balkh, known to the ancient Greeks as Bactra. Located in the north
of today's Afghanistan, along the silk road, Balkh was holy to many. The Prophet Zoroaster is rumored to
have died here, and during late antiquity, Balkh was the home of the Naw Bahar, a famed Buddhist temple
and monastery. By the tenth century, Balkh had become a critical center of Islamic learning and early poetry
in the New Persian language that grew after the Islamic conquests and continues to be spoken in Iran,
Afghanistan and parts of Central Asia today.

In this book, Arezou Azad provides the first in-depth study of the sacred sites and landscape of medieval
Balkh, which continues to exemplify age-old sanctity in the Persian-speaking world and the eastern lands of
Islam generally. Azad focuses on the five centuries from the Islamic conquests in the eighth century to just
before the arrival of the Mongols in the thirteenth century, the crucial period in the emergence of Perso-
Islamic historiography and Islamic legal thought. The book traces the development of 'sacred landscape', the
notion that a place has a sensory meaning, as distinct from a purely topographical space. This opens up new
possibilities for our understanding of Islamisation in the eastern Islamic lands, and specifically the transition
from Buddhism to Islam. Azad offers a new look at the medieval local history of Balkh, the Fada'il-i Balkh,
and analyzes its creation of a sacred landscape for Balkh. In doing so, she provides a compelling example of
how the sacredness of a place is perpetuated through narratives, irrespective of the dominant religion or
religious strand of the time.
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From reader reviews:

Angela Jones:

The book Sacred Landscape in Medieval Afghanistan: Revisiting the Fad=a'il-i Balkh (Oxford Oriental
Monographs) can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want.
Why must we leave the great thing like a book Sacred Landscape in Medieval Afghanistan: Revisiting the
Fad=a'il-i Balkh (Oxford Oriental Monographs)? A few of you have a different opinion about book. But one
aim that will book can give many details for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer with your
book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you could share all of
these. Book Sacred Landscape in Medieval Afghanistan: Revisiting the Fad=a'il-i Balkh (Oxford Oriental
Monographs) has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can
appear the enormous world by wide open and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Aaron Martinez:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their free time with their family, or
their very own friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, about to beach, or picnic within
the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something different to fill
your current free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book is usually option to fill your cost-free time/ holiday.
The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to try look for
book, may be the e-book untitled Sacred Landscape in Medieval Afghanistan: Revisiting the Fad=a'il-i Balkh
(Oxford Oriental Monographs) can be good book to read. May be it could be best activity to you.

Raul Warren:

Is it you who having spare time and then spend it whole day through watching television programs or just
resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Sacred Landscape in Medieval Afghanistan:
Revisiting the Fad=a'il-i Balkh (Oxford Oriental Monographs) can be the response, oh how comes? The new
book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this new era is common not
a nerd activity. So what these guides have than the others?

Minerva Garrison:

In this particular era which is the greater person or who has ability to do something more are more treasured
than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple method to have that. What you should do is
just spending your time not much but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of many books in the
top checklist in your reading list is Sacred Landscape in Medieval Afghanistan: Revisiting the Fad=a'il-i
Balkh (Oxford Oriental Monographs). This book that is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in
turning out to be precious person. By looking upward and review this guide you can get many advantages.
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