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The term "smart city" defines the new urban environment, one that is designed for performance through
information and communication technologies. Given that the majority of people across the world will live in
urban environments within the next few decades, it's not surprising that massive effort and investment is
being placed into efforts to develop strategies and plans for achieving "smart" urban growth. Building
Smart Cities: Analytics, ICT, and Design Thinking explains the technology and a methodology known as
design thinking for building smart cities.

Information and communications technologies form the backbone of smart cities. A comprehensive and
robust data analytics program enables the right choices to be made in building these cities. Design thinking
helps to create smart cities that are both livable and able to evolve. This book examines all of these
components in the context of smart city development and shows how to use them in an integrated manner.

Using the principles of design thinking to reframe the problems of the smart city and capture the real needs
of people living in a highly efficient urban environment, the book helps city planners and technologists
through the following:

Presentation of the relevant technologies required for coordinated, efficient cities●

Exploration of the latent needs of community stakeholders in a culturally appropriate context●

Discussion of the tested approaches to ideation, design, prototyping, and building or retrofitting smart cities●

Proposal of a model for a viable smart city project●

The smart city vision that we can create an optimized society through technology is hypothetical at best and
reflects the failed repetition through the ages of equating scientific progress with positive social change. Up
until now, despite our best hopes and efforts, technology has yet to bring an end to scarcity or suffering.
Technical innovation, instead, can and should be directed in the service of our shared cultural values,
especially within the rapidly growing urban milieu.

In Building Smart Cities: Analytics, ICT, and Design Thinking, the author discusses the need to focus on
creating human-centered approaches to our cities that integrate our human needs and technology to meet our
economic, environmental, and existential needs. The book shows how this approach can lead to innovative,
livable urban environments that are realizable, practical, and economically and environmentally sustainable.
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From reader reviews:

Vivian Bennett:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be change about what going on or info even knowledge
to make them keep up with the era which can be always change and advance. Some of you maybe can update
themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to you is you
don't know what one you should start with. This Building Smart Cities: Analytics, ICT, and Design Thinking
is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and
wish in this era.

James Goldman:

Typically the book Building Smart Cities: Analytics, ICT, and Design Thinking will bring you to definitely
the new experience of reading the book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. In the event
you try to find new book to study, this book very acceptable to you. The book Building Smart Cities:
Analytics, ICT, and Design Thinking is much recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book from
official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Patricia Stroud:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their down time with their family,
or their friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, about to beach, or picnic within the
park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to fill
your own free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book is usually option to fill your totally free time/ holiday.
The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to attempt look for
book, may be the book untitled Building Smart Cities: Analytics, ICT, and Design Thinking can be very
good book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

James Waddell:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book ended up being
rare? Why so many query for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some
people likes examining, not only science book but also novel and Building Smart Cities: Analytics, ICT, and
Design Thinking or even others sources were given information for you. After you know how the great a
book, you feel desire to read more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher or maybe students
especially. Those guides are helping them to put their knowledge. In various other case, beside science
reserve, any other book likes Building Smart Cities: Analytics, ICT, and Design Thinking to make your spare
time far more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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