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America’s beloved and distinguished historian presents, in a book of breathtaking excitement, drama, and
narrative force, the stirring story of the year of our nation’s birth, 1776, interweaving, on both sides of the
Atlantic, the actions and decisions that led Great Britain to undertake a war against her rebellious colonial
subjects and that placed America’s survival in the hands of George Washington.

In this masterful book, David McCullough tells the intensely human story of those who marched with
General George Washington in the year of the Declaration of Independence—when the whole American
cause was riding on their success, without which all hope for independence would have been dashed and the
noble ideals of the Declaration would have amounted to little more than words on paper.

Based on extensive research in both American and British archives, 1776 is a powerful drama written with
extraordinary narrative vitality. It is the story of Americans in the ranks, men of every shape, size, and color,
farmers, schoolteachers, shoemakers, no-accounts, and mere boys turned soldiers. And it is the story of the
King’s men, the British commander, William Howe, and his highly disciplined redcoats who looked on their
rebel foes with contempt and fought with a valor too little known.

Written as a companion work to his celebrated biography of John Adams, David McCullough’s 1776 is
another landmark in the literature of American history.
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From reader reviews:

James Goldman:

The book 1776 can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. So why must we leave
the best thing like a book 1776? Some of you have a different opinion about e-book. But one aim in which
book can give many data for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge
or details that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you may share all of these. Book 1776
has simple shape however, you know: it has great and big function for you. You can appear the enormous
world by open and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Jacqueline Morrison:

Now a day folks who Living in the era just where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not involve people to be aware of each facts they get. How many people to
be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Reading
through a book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information specially this 1776 book since this book
offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred pct guarantees there is
no doubt in it you know.

Lorenzo Maskell:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them family or their
friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or perhaps playing video
games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read the book. It is
really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent 24 hours a day to reading a
publication. The book 1776 it is very good to read. There are a lot of those who recommended this book. We
were holding enjoying reading this book. When you did not have enough space to develop this book you can
buy often the e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book from your smart phone. The price is not too
expensive but this book offers high quality.

Eric Rodriguez:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got scholars? We believe that that concern
was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And also you
know that little person like reading or as reading become their hobby. You need to understand that reading is
very important in addition to book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except
your own teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update regarding something by book. Numerous books
that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is 1776.
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