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These sermons -hall be preached at such time ami place as the -aid Trustees of The e-teru Theological
Seminary. Chicago. llinoN. may appoint, and shall be printed in a tyle -imilar to -he Sermons of this kind
already published under my direction, viz: (onf icianisin in its relation to Christianity, and The U.-linion of
the Dakota-,. ()ne hundred copies of each of these Sermons are to be given, so soon as they come from the
press, to the preacher thereof, and one copy of such Sermon is, so soon thereafter as may be, to be sent to ach
Bishop in the Anglican Communion, and to such other Bishops as may be in full communion with these
Bishops, to the Patriarch and other chief Hierarchy of the Orthodox Eastern Churches, and ..the chief Public
Libraries throughout the vorld. Should it be, at any time, denned expedient to offer any of these Sermons for
sale, the entire receipts over and above the expenses incurred in such sale, shall lie given to The Domestic
and Foreign Missionary Society of the Protestant Epi-copal Church in the United States of A merica. a
Corporation existing under the laws of the State of Xew York, for the uses of said Society. The preacher of
the Hale Memorial Sermon shall always be a clergyman of the American Church, commonly called The
Protestant Episcopal Church, or of some Church in communion with the same, or of one of the Orthodox
Eastern Churches The Western Theological Seminary has gladly accepted the Trusteeship as outlined in the
above extracts from the will of the late Bishop Hale. It will be the aim of the Seminary, through the Hale
Sermons, to make from time to time some valuable contributions to some of the Church problems of the day,
without thereby committing itself to the utterances of its own selected Preachers.
(Typographical errors above are due to OCR software and don't occur in the book.)
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From reader reviews:

Graciela Cook:

The book untitled The Work Memorial Sermon Negroes in the South Among the Negroes in the South
(Classic Reprint) contain a lot of information on this. The writer explains the woman idea with easy
technique. The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to
read that. The book was written by famous author. The author brings you in the new period of literary works.
It is easy to read this book because you can keep reading your smart phone, or program, so you can read the
book inside anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can available their
official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice learn.

Geraldine Carlson:

Is it anyone who having spare time in that case spend it whole day through watching television programs or
just lying down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Work Memorial Sermon Negroes
in the South Among the Negroes in the South (Classic Reprint) can be the respond to, oh how comes? A
fresh book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your time by reading in this new era is
common not a nerd activity. So what these guides have than the others?

Joe Garner:

You can find this The Work Memorial Sermon Negroes in the South Among the Negroes in the South
(Classic Reprint) by go to the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it might to be your solve
trouble if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various. Not only simply by
written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern era including
now, you just looking by your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your
personal ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately
make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.

Frank Foushee:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got learners? We believe that that problem
was given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. So you know
that little person including reading or as looking at become their hobby. You should know that reading is
very important as well as book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge, except
your teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update regarding something by book. Different
categories of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is The Work Memorial Sermon
Negroes in the South Among the Negroes in the South (Classic Reprint).
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