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Who knew that the great country of Canada is named for a mistake? How about "bedswerver," the best
Elizabethan insult to hurl at a cheating boyfriend? By exploring the delightful back stories of the 250 words
in Wordcatcher, readers are lured by language and entangled in etymologies. Author Phil Cousineau takes us
on a tour into the obscure territory of word origins with great erudition and endearing curiosity. The English
poet W. H. Auden was once asked to teach a poetry class, and when 200 students applied to study with him,
he only had room for 20 of them. When asked how he chose his students, he said he picked the ones who
actually loved words. So too, with this book — it takes a special wordcatcher to create a treasure chest of
remarkable words and their origins, and any word lover will relish the stories that Cousineau has discovered.
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From reader reviews:

Evelyn Blow:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for
us to know everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that reserve has
different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They may be
reading whatever they get because their hobby is actually reading a book. Why not the person who don't like
reading a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book if they found difficult problem or maybe exercise.
Well, probably you should have this Wordcatcher: An Odyssey into the World of Weird and Wonderful
Words.

Carolyn Hoffman:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With looking at you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world can share
their idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their own reader with their story
or even their experience. Not only situation that share in the publications. But also they write about the
knowledge about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
young ones, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their
expertise in writing, they also doing some research before they write for their book. One of them is this
Wordcatcher: An Odyssey into the World of Weird and Wonderful Words.

Curtis Dugan:

Wordcatcher: An Odyssey into the World of Weird and Wonderful Words can be one of your beginning
books that are good idea. Many of us recommend that straight away because this e-book has good
vocabulary that could increase your knowledge in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining but
nonetheless delivering the information. The author giving his/her effort that will put every word into
enjoyment arrangement in writing Wordcatcher: An Odyssey into the World of Weird and Wonderful Words
yet doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource info that
maybe you can be considered one of it. This great information can certainly drawn you into brand-new stage
of crucial imagining.

Thomas Daniels:

This Wordcatcher: An Odyssey into the World of Weird and Wonderful Words is great book for you because
the content which can be full of information for you who have always deal with world and get to make
decision every minute. This book reveal it info accurately using great coordinate word or we can state no
rambling sentences included. So if you are read the idea hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't
mean it only gives you straight forward sentences but hard core information with wonderful delivering
sentences. Having Wordcatcher: An Odyssey into the World of Weird and Wonderful Words in your hand



like having the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no guide that offer
you world throughout ten or fifteen minute right but this e-book already do that. So , this can be good
reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt this?
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