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Charles Dickens' all-time classic "A Christmas Carol". The tale begins on Christmas Eve seven years after
the death of Ebenezer Scrooge's business partner Jacob Marley. Scrooge is established within the first stave
(chapter) as a greedy and stingy businessman who has no place in his life for kindness, compassion, charity,
or benevolence. After being warned by Marley's ghost to change his ways, Scrooge is visited by three
additional ghosts "each in its turn" who accompany him to various scenes with the hope of achieving his
transformation. The first of the spirits, the Ghost of Christmas Past, takes Scrooge to the scenes of his
boyhood and youth which stir the old miser's gentle and tender side by reminding him of a time when he was
more innocent. The second spirit, the Ghost of Christmas Present, takes Scrooge to several radically differing
scenes (a joy-filled market of people buying the makings of Christmas dinner, the family feast of Scrooge's
near-impoverished clerk Bob Cratchit, a miner's cottage, and a lighthouse among other sites) in order to
evince from the miser a sense of responsibility for his fellow man. The third spirit, the Ghost of Christmas
Yet to Come, harrows Scrooge with dire visions of the future if he does not learn and act upon what he has
witnessed. Scrooge's own neglected and untended grave is revealed, prompting the miser to aver that he will
change his ways in hopes of changing these "shadows of what may be." In the fifth and final stave, Scrooge
awakens Christmas morning with joy and love in his heart, then spends the day with his nephew's family
after anonymously sending a prize turkey to the Crachit home for Christmas dinner. Scrooge has become a
different man overnight, and now treats his fellow men with kindness, generosity, and compassion, gaining a
reputation as a man who embodies the spirit of Christmas. The story closes with the narrator confirming the
validity, completeness, and permanence of Scrooge's transformation.
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From reader reviews:

Maxine Lucas:

What do you consider book? It is just for students as they are still students or the item for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that question above. Every person
has several personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they don't
wish do that. You must know how great as well as important the book A Christmas Carol. All type of book
could you see on many sources. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Larry Young:

Now a day people that Living in the era where everything reachable by connect with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not involve people to be aware of each data they get. How people have to
be smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Looking at a book can
help persons out of this uncertainty Information specially this A Christmas Carol book since this book offers
you rich details and knowledge. Of course the information in this book hundred per cent guarantees there is
no doubt in it as you know.

Vincent Humphreys:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information today can get by anyone at
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even a concern. What people must be consider
while those information which is inside former life are difficult to be find than now is taking seriously which
one is suitable to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable resource
then you obtain it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities
will not happen within you if you take A Christmas Carol as the daily resource information.

Shaun Sae:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got students? We believe that that question was
given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. Therefore you know
that little person just like reading or as reading become their hobby. You have to know that reading is very
important in addition to book as to be the point. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge, except
your current teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update regarding something by book. Numerous
books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is this A Christmas Carol.
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