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Fred I. Greenstein has long been one of our keenest observers of the modern presidency. In The Presidential
Difference, he provides a fascinating and instructive account of the presidential qualities that have served
well and poorly in the Oval Office, beginning with Franklin D. Roosevelt's first hundred days. He surveys
each president's political skill, vision, cognitive style, organizational capacity, ability to communicate, and
emotional intelligence--and argues that the last is the most important in predicting presidential success.
Throughout, Greenstein offers a series of bottom-line judgments on each of his thirteen subjects as well as an
overarching theory of why presidents succeed or fail.

In this new edition, Greenstein assesses President George W. Bush in the wake of his two terms. The book
also includes a new chapter on the leadership style of President Obama and how we can expect it to affect his
presidency and legacy.
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From reader reviews:

Karole Standley:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yes, you can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time
to take a walk, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or maybe read a book allowed The
Presidential Difference: Leadership Style from FDR to Barack Obama, Third edition? Maybe it is being best
activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can wiser than
before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you have additional opinion?

Betty Ahlstrom:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them friends
and family or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching
TV, or playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity this is look different you
can read the book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent
all day long to reading a guide. The book The Presidential Difference: Leadership Style from FDR to Barack
Obama, Third edition it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this
book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. When you did not have enough space to create this book
you can buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book from your smart phone. The price is
not to fund but this book offers high quality.

Terrance Allen:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always try and and must have the spare time or they will get lots of
stress from both everyday life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely
indeed. People is human not only a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity do you have when the
spare time coming to you of course your answer will unlimited right. Then ever try this one, reading books.
It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, typically the book you have read is usually The
Presidential Difference: Leadership Style from FDR to Barack Obama, Third edition.

Curt Roepke:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside along with friends, fun activity using family or
just watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by reading through a
book. Ugh, do you think reading a book can actually hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It
ok you can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like The Presidential
Difference: Leadership Style from FDR to Barack Obama, Third edition which is keeping the e-book
version. So , why not try out this book? Let's notice.
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