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The alchemist Fulcanelli was the most famous adept of the 20th century, the man who achieved the Great
Work less than 100 years ago, but his true identity has always been shrouded in myth and uninformed
speculation...until now. Patrick Rivière reveals with profuse documentary evidence the true identity of the
enigmatic and prestigious author of The Mystery of the Cathedrals and The Dwellings of the Philosophers.
Beginning with an overview of French alchemical life at the turn of the 20th century, Rivière carefully builds
his case step-by-step with facts, documents, and photographs, introducing us to the well-known physicist
who was known as Fulcanelli. Rivière also demolishes the scurrilous hypotheses that suggest Fulcanelli
never existed. Rivière is uniquely suited to solving this mystery as his teacher was Fulcanelli's sole student,
Eugène Canseliet.
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From reader reviews:

Lucille Roller:

Now a day those who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by interact with the internet and
the resources within it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each data they get. How a lot more to
be smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Reading a
book can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Fulcanelli - His True Identity
Revealed book as this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book
hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Sharonda Adair:

This book untitled Fulcanelli - His True Identity Revealed to be one of several books this best seller in this
year, here is because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this
kind of book in the book retail store or you can order it by way of online. The publisher of this book sells the
e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, as you can read this book in your Touch screen phone. So
there is no reason to you personally to past this guide from your list.

Luis Morales:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because this time you only find book that
need more time to be go through. Fulcanelli - His True Identity Revealed can be your answer because it can
be read by an individual who have those short time problems.

Christine Brooks:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is published or printed or outlined from each source which filled update of
news. In this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media
social like newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can
add your knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
searching for the Fulcanelli - His True Identity Revealed when you essential it?
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