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At 30...

Former vice-presidential candidate Geraldine Ferraro was a stay-at-home mother. Founder and CEO of
Oxygen Media Geraldine Laybourne was working at a public interest think tank for teachers. Political
strategist Mary Matalin was a first-year law student--and about to drop out. And months prior to her thirtieth
birthday, financial strategist and best-selling author Suze Orman was working as a waitress, making $400 a
month.

Decades later, these Boomer women and many others have reached the pinnacles of their professions. So
why do Gen-X/Y women feel such pressure to have the perfect career, body, husband, and kids by the time
they are at or around 30? Why has 30 become such a make-or-break moment?

As the generation that came of age after the most visible glass ceilings had been broken, Gen-X/Y women
were raised to believe in futures without limitations. Yet, as journalists Lia Macko and Kerry Rubin reveal in
their fascinating investigation, many women have distorted the well-intentioned empowerment messages of
their youth and are quietly blaming themselves when they fail to overcome the very real obstacles that still
exist in our society. Though many Gen-X/Y women are hitting the same roadblocks at the same time, instead
of questioning what's wrong with the system--as Boomer women did in their twenties--they're questioning
their own "choices."

Searching for solutions, Macko and Rubin have enlisted the aid of the New Girls' Club, a group of
successful, satisfied women who've lived through their own crossroads moments, earned their battle scars,
and now share their stories and strategies. While today's young women may indeed be a generation in the
middle of a Midlife Crisis at 30, they now have a dream team of mentors to help guide them through it.
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From reader reviews:

Kyle Coffman:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to take a walk,
shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or maybe read a book called Midlife Crisis at
30: How the Stakes Have Changed for a New Generation-And What to Do about It? Maybe it is to become
best activity for you. You recognize beside you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can more
intelligent than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have various other opinion?

Joshua McIntosh:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the headline Midlife Crisis
at 30: How the Stakes Have Changed for a New Generation-And What to Do about It suitable to you? The
actual book was written by famous writer in this era. The book untitled Midlife Crisis at 30: How the Stakes
Have Changed for a New Generation-And What to Do about Itis the main of several books which everyone
read now. This book was inspired many men and women in the world. When you read this publication you
will enter the new shape that you ever know prior to. The author explained their concept in the simple way,
consequently all of people can easily to recognise the core of this reserve. This book will give you a lots of
information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world in this book.

Patrice Reese:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind talent
or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book in comparison with can
satisfy your small amount of time to read it because this all time you only find guide that need more time to
be learn. Midlife Crisis at 30: How the Stakes Have Changed for a New Generation-And What to Do about It
can be your answer because it can be read by anyone who have those short extra time problems.

Katrina Hering:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Midlife Crisis at 30: How the Stakes Have
Changed for a New Generation-And What to Do about It was colourful and of course has pictures on there.
As we know that book Midlife Crisis at 30: How the Stakes Have Changed for a New Generation-And What
to Do about It has many kinds or type. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or Investigator
Conan you can read and believe that you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are usually
make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and
try to like reading this.
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