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If you litigate or preside in any court in the state of New York, you know just how confounding the state's
evidence law can be. New York Evidence Handbook is the new, comprehensive guide to all of the rules and
principles of evidence applicable in New York courts. This new 1,000 page handbook presents a practical,
contemporary approach to evidence -- written with the real-world challenges of the New York trial lawyer
and judge in mind. It gathers into one, easy-to-use handbook all of the rules, the leading decisions, and the
significant statutes you need to consider when assessing the admissibility of evidence. The book walks you
through all the rules and their operation (as they relate to judicial notice, presumptions, relevance, the "best
evidence" rule, etc.) discussing all of the leading authorities, and citing numerous trial examples.

Throughout New York Evidence Handbook, special attention is paid to helping you quickly solve commonly
encountered, but difficult, evidence questions. Without requiring you to pore through older cases of little
precedential value, you'll find the latest rules, cases and analysis on:

Expert evidence - Including DNA profiling, expert opinions based on facts not in evidence●

Hearsay - Confrontation Clause problems, prior statements of witnesses, admissions by employees, hearsay●

included in business records
Privileges - Attorney client-privilege in the corporate setting, inadvertent or selective waivers, privileges●

for health care professionals
Witnesses - Impeachment by prior convictions and bad acts, evidence from hypnotized witnesses, prior●

inconsistent and consistent statements
Relevancy - Chain of custody for physical evidence, gory photographs, character and uncharged crimes,●

stipulations.
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From reader reviews:

Paul Butler:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading practice give
you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the
book that improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of e-book you
read, if you want send more knowledge just go with education books but if you want feel happy read one
having theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. Often the New York Evidence Handbook, Second
Edition is kind of e-book which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Timothy Roesch:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information presently can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even restricted. What people must be consider
when those information which is in the former life are hard to be find than now is taking seriously which one
works to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable resource then you
understand it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities will
not happen within you if you take New York Evidence Handbook, Second Edition as the daily resource
information.

Joseph Mattie:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind skill or
thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book compared to can
satisfy your small amount of time to read it because this time you only find book that need more time to be
study. New York Evidence Handbook, Second Edition can be your answer since it can be read by an
individual who have those short extra time problems.

Richard Barbosa:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is created or printed or outlined from each source in which filled update of news. In this
particular modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media
social similar to newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
trying to find the New York Evidence Handbook, Second Edition when you essential it?
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