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Since the first Earth Day in 1970, environmentalism has become woven into the fabric of American life.
Concern for environmental quality has influenced how we think, work, and recreate; what we buy; and how
we govern. But popular consensus on the environment is more complicated than it appears. The real question
is no longer whether Americans side with environmentalism, but the depth of their commitment. This book
argues that understanding public opinion, the grassroots of the "green" revolution, is essential to sustaining
genuine environmental progress. The long-term success of the environmental movement will be measured
not only by its legislative achievements, but by its ability to persuade average citizens to back up their words
with action and to further alter their voting patterns, buying habits, and lifestyles.The Grassroots of a Green
Revolution uses polling data from a wide variety of sources to explore the myths, inconsistencies, and
tensions that characterize public thinking on environmental issues. The book defines and describes key
characteristics of public opinion, including direction, strength, stability, distribution, and consistency, and
shows how those qualities influence behavior. The book uses that body of evidence to weigh the significance
of environmental concern in U.S. politics and policy and to provide pragmatic advice for decisionmakers in
their efforts to motivate Americans to act in an environmentally responsible way.
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From reader reviews:

William Davis:

Now a day people that Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by interact with the internet and
the resources within it can be true or not need people to be aware of each facts they get. How many people to
be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Studying a book can
help people out of this uncertainty Information particularly this The Grassroots of a Green Revolution:
Polling America on the Environment book because this book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course
the details in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Constance Music:

Reading a book to become new life style in this year; every people loves to learn a book. When you read a
book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
simply because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what forms
of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your research, you can read education
books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, this kind of us novel,
comics, and also soon. The The Grassroots of a Green Revolution: Polling America on the Environment
offer you a new experience in reading through a book.

Thomas Moss:

This The Grassroots of a Green Revolution: Polling America on the Environment is brand new way for you
who has attention to look for some information as it relief your hunger associated with. Getting deeper you
on it getting knowledge more you know otherwise you who still having little bit of digest in reading this The
Grassroots of a Green Revolution: Polling America on the Environment can be the light food in your case
because the information inside that book is easy to get simply by anyone. These books develop itself in the
form that is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book type. People who think that in guide form make
them feel sleepy even dizzy this reserve is the answer. So there is no in reading a book especially this one.
You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you actually. So , don't miss the item! Just read this
e-book type for your better life and also knowledge.

Nancy Landry:

A lot of guide has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by online on social media. You can
choose the top book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is known as
of book The Grassroots of a Green Revolution: Polling America on the Environment. You can add your
knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make a person happier
to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one destination to other
place.
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