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One of the great novels of American girlhood, Jean Webster's Daddy-Long-Legs (1912) follows the
adventures of an orphan named Judy Abbott, whose letters to her anonymous male benefactor trace her
development as an independent thinker and writer. Its sequel, Dear Enemy (1915), follows the progress of
Judy's former orphanage, now run by her friend Sallie McBride, who struggles to give her young charges
hope and a new life.

For more than seventy years, Penguin has been the leading publisher of classic literature in the English-
speaking world. With more than 1,700 titles, Penguin Classics represents a global bookshelf of the best
works throughout history and across genres and disciplines. Readers trust the series to provide authoritative
texts enhanced by introductions and notes by distinguished scholars and contemporary authors, as well as
up-to-date translations by award-winning translators.
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From reader reviews:

Alberto Benson:

The knowledge that you get from Daddy-Long-Legs and Dear Enemy (Penguin Classics) may be the more
deep you rooting the information that hide into the words the more you get considering reading it. It does not
mean that this book is hard to understand but Daddy-Long-Legs and Dear Enemy (Penguin Classics) giving
you thrill feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in particular way that can be understood through
anyone who read the item because the author of this guide is well-known enough. This kind of book also
makes your vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can go along with you, both in
printed or e-book style are available. We advise you for having that Daddy-Long-Legs and Dear Enemy
(Penguin Classics) instantly.

Ronald Adams:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with pals is thing that
usually you may have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try factor that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you are ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Daddy-Long-Legs and Dear
Enemy (Penguin Classics), you can enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still would like to miss it?
What kind of hang type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its called
reading friends.

Leonard Jones:

Does one one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Attempt to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't judge book by its include may doesn't
work at this point is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the
outside search likes. Maybe you answer is usually Daddy-Long-Legs and Dear Enemy (Penguin Classics)
why because the fantastic cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint an
individual. The inside or content is fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading 6th sense will
directly assist you to pick up this book.

Christopher Scoville:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind ability or
thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book as compared to
can satisfy your short space of time to read it because this time you only find e-book that need more time to
be go through. Daddy-Long-Legs and Dear Enemy (Penguin Classics) can be your answer mainly because it
can be read by you who have those short spare time problems.
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