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This book is an electromagnetics classic. Originally published in 1941, it has been used by many generations
of students, teachers, and researchers ever since. Since it is classic electromagnetics, every chapter continues
to be referenced to this day.

This classic reissue contains the entire, original edition first published in 1941. Additionally, two new
forewords by Dr. Paul E. Gray (former MIT President and colleague of Dr. Stratton) and another by Dr.
Donald G. Dudley, Editor of the IEEE Press Series on E/M Waves on the significance of the book's
contribution to the field of Electromagnetics.
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From reader reviews:

Gloria Robey:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Sure, you can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to
take a go walking, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book allowed
Electromagnetic Theory? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your
time together with your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or
you have various other opinion?

Sidney Robertson:

The book Electromagnetic Theory can give more knowledge and information about everything you want.
Exactly why must we leave the good thing like a book Electromagnetic Theory? Several of you have a
different opinion about e-book. But one aim which book can give many info for us. It is absolutely proper.
Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you can give for each
other; you may share all of these. Book Electromagnetic Theory has simple shape but you know: it has great
and massive function for you. You can appear the enormous world by available and read a reserve. So it is
very wonderful.

Stacy Brooks:

This Electromagnetic Theory usually are reliable for you who want to be considered a successful person,
why. The explanation of this Electromagnetic Theory can be on the list of great books you must have will be
giving you more than just simple examining food but feed an individual with information that possibly will
shock your before knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it all over the place and whenever your
conditions in the e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this Electromagnetic Theory giving you an enormous
of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that could it useful in your day
action. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Bryan Lewis:

The actual book Electromagnetic Theory will bring one to the new experience of reading a new book. The
author style to clarify the idea is very unique. Should you try to find new book to study, this book very
suitable to you. The book Electromagnetic Theory is much recommended to you to see. You can also get the
e-book through the official web site, so you can easier to read the book.
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