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UNESCO estimates that eleven percent of primary school–age children?seventy-two million worldwide?are
not enrolled in or attending school. Children who do attend may find themselves in schools that lack
adequate space, facilities, or resources?impossible situations for learning. It is against this backdrop of
profound need that One Laptop per Child (OLPC) emerged in 2005. The mission of the organization is to
"empower the children of developing countries to learn." They created the first affordable netbook
specifically built to withstand harsh climates and the handling of young children?the bright green and white
XO. At the 2005 World Economic Forum, Nicholas Negroponte, the MIT researcher who co-founded the
Media Lab and OLPC, introduced the XO laptop to the world and described a new approach to changing
education in developing countries. First, children must have access to information (through low-cost data
communications) and the tools to educate themselves (affordable computers and learning software).
Secondly, the fundamental approach to education must shift from passive knowledge acquisition to active
construction of knowledge (learning how to learn). Thirdly, OLPC planned to build an organization with the
capability to deliver these computers and support these shifts globally. It was an audacious vision of how to
bring about a massive educational change.

Learning to Change the World is the story of One Laptop per Child?a story that will resonate with
entrepreneurs and social innovators in any field. OLPC is an example of a non-profit organization with
aspirations for systemic change on a global scale, yet wrestling with tough questions that will be familiar to
any social entrepreneur: how to ensure market forces support the scale up of a social program; how to
balance the need to repeat past successes but still leave room for innovation; how to leverage a network to
expand impact beyond your original capabilities; and how to help people without creating dependence.

The authors set out to tell the real story of their journey?both successes and failures. For both ardent
supporters and critics alike, this book presents both an invitation and a challenge: to set aside preconceived
notions about OLPC and read the inside story of the origins and evolution of the organization.
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From reader reviews:

John McCord:

The book Learning to Change the World: The Social Impact of One Laptop Per Child can give more
knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. So why must we leave the
great thing like a book Learning to Change the World: The Social Impact of One Laptop Per Child? A few of
you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim that will book can give many facts for us. It is
absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you
are able to give for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book Learning to Change the World: The
Social Impact of One Laptop Per Child has simple shape however you know: it has great and large function
for you. You can look the enormous world by open and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

June Weiss:

Here thing why this particular Learning to Change the World: The Social Impact of One Laptop Per Child
are different and reputable to be yours. First of all reading a book is good but it depends in the content from
it which is the content is as yummy as food or not. Learning to Change the World: The Social Impact of One
Laptop Per Child giving you information deeper and different ways, you can find any book out there but
there is no publication that similar with Learning to Change the World: The Social Impact of One Laptop Per
Child. It gives you thrill examining journey, its open up your eyes about the thing which happened in the
world which is perhaps can be happened around you. You can actually bring everywhere like in recreation
area, café, or even in your means home by train. For anyone who is having difficulties in bringing the
imprinted book maybe the form of Learning to Change the World: The Social Impact of One Laptop Per
Child in e-book can be your substitute.

Mary Banks:

This Learning to Change the World: The Social Impact of One Laptop Per Child tend to be reliable for you
who want to be a successful person, why. The main reason of this Learning to Change the World: The Social
Impact of One Laptop Per Child can be among the great books you must have is giving you more than just
simple reading through food but feed you with information that maybe will shock your before knowledge.
This book is actually handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your conditions both in e-
book and printed versions. Beside that this Learning to Change the World: The Social Impact of One Laptop
Per Child forcing you to have an enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary, giving you demo of
critical thinking that could it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Kathy Lloyd:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many issue for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some
people likes reading through, not only science book but also novel and Learning to Change the World: The



Social Impact of One Laptop Per Child or even others sources were given expertise for you. After you know
how the truly great a book, you feel desire to read more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher or
maybe students especially. Those guides are helping them to bring their knowledge. In different case, beside
science e-book, any other book likes Learning to Change the World: The Social Impact of One Laptop Per
Child to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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