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This contains the first 8 of the 12 stories in the published book The Man Who Knew Too Much and Other
Stories. In these 8 detective thrillers, the main protagonist is Horne Fisher. (The omitted four are individual
stories with separate heroes/detectives.) Due to close relationships with the leading political figures in the
land, Fisher knows too much about the private politics behind the public politics of the day. This knowledge
is a burden to him because he is able to uncover the injustices and corruptions of the murders in each story,
but in most cases the real killer gets away with the killing because to bring him openly to justice would
create a greater chaos: starting a war, reinciting Irish rebellions, or removing public faith in the government.
A film of the same title was made in 1934 and remade in 1956, both directed by Alfred Hitchcock, but the
films had nothing at all in common (except the title) with these short stories. Hitchcock decided to use the
title simply because he had the rights for some of the stories.
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From reader reviews:

Gerald Warfield:

The book The Man Who Knew Too Much can give more knowledge and information about everything you
want. So just why must we leave the great thing like a book The Man Who Knew Too Much? Several of you
have a different opinion about e-book. But one aim that will book can give many details for us. It is
absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or information that you take
for that, it is possible to give for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book The Man Who Knew
Too Much has simple shape however, you know: it has great and big function for you. You can appearance
the enormous world by start and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Curtis Wilson:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information today can get by anyone on everywhere. The
information can be a understanding or any news even a problem. What people must be consider if those
information which is inside the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking seriously which one
would work to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable resource
then you get it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities
will not happen throughout you if you take The Man Who Knew Too Much as the daily resource
information.

Derek Wire:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try to and must have the extra time or they will get lots of
stress from both daily life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have spare time, we will say absolutely
sure. People is human not really a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity do you possess when
the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you ever try this
one, reading guides. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, typically the book you have
read is usually The Man Who Knew Too Much.

Clyde Okane:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you could have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try thing that really
opposite from that. One particular activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you are ride on and with addition of information. Even you love The Man Who Knew Too
Much, you can enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of
hang-out type is it? Oh seriously its mind hangout men. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its
identified as reading friends.
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