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LEGENDARY founding KISS drummer Peter “Catman” Criss has lived an incredible life in music, from the
streets of Brooklyn to the social clubs of New York City to the ultimate heights of rock ’n’ roll success and
excess.

KISS formed in 1973 and broke new ground with their elaborate makeup, live theatrics, and powerful sound.
The band emerged as one of the most iconic hard rock acts in music history. Peter Criss, the Catman, was the
heartbeat of the group. From an elevated perch on his pyrotechnic drum riser, he had a unique vantage point
on the greatest rock show of all time, with the KISS Army looking back at him night after night.

Peter Criscuola had come a long way from the homemade drum set he pounded on nonstop as a kid growing
up in Brooklyn in the fifties. He endured lean years, street violence, and the rollercoaster music scene of the
sixties, but he always knew he’d make it. Makeup to Breakup is Peter Criss’s eye-opening journey from the
pledge to his ma that he’d one day play Madison Square Garden to doing just that. He conquered the rock
world—composing and singing his band’s all-time biggest hit, “Beth” (1976)—but he also faced the perils of
stardom and his own mortality, including drug abuse, treatment in 1982, near-suicides, two broken
marriages, and a hard-won battle with breast cancer.

Criss opens up with a level of honesty and emotion previously unseen in any musician’s memoir. Makeup to
Breakup is the definitive and heartfelt account of one of rock’s most iconic figures, and the importance of
faith and family. Rock ’n’ roll has been chronicled many times, but never quite like this.
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From reader reviews:

Robin Blakely:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yep, you
can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a
wander, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or read a book titled Makeup to Breakup: My
Life In and Out of Kiss? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time
using your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have
additional opinion?

Rosemary Till:

Book is usually written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
book. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important matter to bring us around the
world. Next to that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A reserve Makeup to Breakup: My Life In
and Out of Kiss will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know
about almost everything. But some of you think this open or reading a new book make you bored. It isn't
make you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you in search of best book or suited book with you?

Leticia Bennet:

Does one one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Attempt to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't judge book by its cover may doesn't work
is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the outside seem likes.
Maybe you answer can be Makeup to Breakup: My Life In and Out of Kiss why because the wonderful cover
that make you consider about the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content is definitely fantastic
as the outside or even cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.

Michael Larose:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many issue for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some people
likes looking at, not only science book but novel and Makeup to Breakup: My Life In and Out of Kiss as
well as others sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how the great a book, you feel would
like to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or perhaps students especially. Those
ebooks are helping them to bring their knowledge. In additional case, beside science guide, any other book
likes Makeup to Breakup: My Life In and Out of Kiss to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types
of book like here.
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