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With an Introduction by Dr Pamela Knights, Department of English Studies, Durham University

This is the only critical edition of this perennially popular story. Sally Shuttleworth's introduction finds,
beneath the idyllic evocation of rural bliss and a tale of love and high adventure, a startling sub-text which
rigidly defends Victorian values, and portrays a `manly' hero constantly having to prove his masculinity to
himself.
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From reader reviews:

Christopher Cunningham:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content. As you may
know that book is very important for us. The book Lorna Doone (Wordsworth Classics) was making you to
know about other information and of course you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you.
The guide Lorna Doone (Wordsworth Classics) is not only giving you more new information but also being
your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your personal spend time to read your guide. Try to make
relationship together with the book Lorna Doone (Wordsworth Classics). You never sense lose out for
everything if you read some books.

Latoya Brown:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading
behavior give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information
inside the book that will improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of
e-book you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with training books but if you want experience
happy read one having theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The actual Lorna Doone (Wordsworth
Classics) is kind of guide which is giving the reader capricious experience.

John Bennett:

This Lorna Doone (Wordsworth Classics) tend to be reliable for you who want to become a successful
person, why. The key reason why of this Lorna Doone (Wordsworth Classics) can be one of several great
books you must have is definitely giving you more than just simple reading food but feed you actually with
information that maybe will shock your previous knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it just about
everywhere and whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed people. Beside that this Lorna
Doone (Wordsworth Classics) forcing you to have an enormous of experience for instance rich vocabulary,
giving you test of critical thinking that we understand it useful in your day task. So , let's have it and
luxuriate in reading.

Stephen Mosley:

Reading a book to get new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to go through a book. When
you go through a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your
knowledge, simply because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend
on what forms of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your research, you can read
education books, but if you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics,
and also soon. The Lorna Doone (Wordsworth Classics) will give you new experience in reading through a
book.
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