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Happiness is something everyone desires. Yet how to find happiness–or even if we deserve to–remains a
mystery. Still more mysterious is the secret to a lasting happiness that cannot be taken away. In The Ultimate
Happiness Prescription, bestselling author Deepak Chopra shows us seven keys to uncover the true secrets
of joy in the most difficult times.

The goal of life is the expansion of happiness, he contends. But in today’s demanding world, that goal seems
elusive, if not impossibly out of reach. Society reinforces the belief that fulfillment comes from achieving
success, wealth, and good relationships. Yet Chopra tells us that the opposite is true: all success in life is the
by-product of happiness, not the cause.

So what is the cause? The Ultimate Happiness Prescription shares spiritual principles for a life based on a
sense of your “true self” lying beyond the ebb and flow of daily living. Simple daily exercises lead to
eliminating the root causes of unhappiness and letting a deeper level of bliss unfold.

After all avenues to happiness have been explored and exhausted, only one path is left: the journey to
enlightenment. In The Ultimate Happiness Prescription, the daunting and exotic challenge of finding
enlightenment becomes accessible step by step. We are taken on an inspiring journey to the true self, the
only place untouched by trouble and misfortune.

On the way we learn the secrets for living mindfully and with effortless spontaneity. Now happiness is no
longer hostage to external events but an experience we carry with us always. As Chopra inspiringly
concludes, “Everything we fear in the world and want to change can be transformed through happiness, the
simplest desire we have, and also the most profound.”
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From reader reviews:

Lee Parkin:

As people who live in the modest era should be up-date about what going on or facts even knowledge to
make these keep up with the era that is always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe may update
themselves by examining books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems coming to anyone is
you don't know what one you should start with. This The Ultimate Happiness Prescription: 7 Keys to Joy and
Enlightenment is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what
you want and wish in this era.

Gary Morrell:

The experience that you get from The Ultimate Happiness Prescription: 7 Keys to Joy and Enlightenment
could be the more deep you digging the information that hide inside the words the more you get enthusiastic
about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to understand but The Ultimate Happiness
Prescription: 7 Keys to Joy and Enlightenment giving you buzz feeling of reading. The article author
conveys their point in selected way that can be understood through anyone who read that because the author
of this e-book is well-known enough. This specific book also makes your current vocabulary increase well.
Making it easy to understand then can go along, both in printed or e-book style are available. We advise you
for having this specific The Ultimate Happiness Prescription: 7 Keys to Joy and Enlightenment instantly.

Cynthia Gomez:

The reserve untitled The Ultimate Happiness Prescription: 7 Keys to Joy and Enlightenment is the guide that
recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the reserve content that will be shown to you.
The language that publisher use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The author was did a lot of
analysis when write the book, therefore the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You
also can get the e-book of The Ultimate Happiness Prescription: 7 Keys to Joy and Enlightenment from the
publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Stacie Schneider:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind skill
or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book than can satisfy
your short time to read it because this time you only find e-book that need more time to be examine. The
Ultimate Happiness Prescription: 7 Keys to Joy and Enlightenment can be your answer since it can be read
by a person who have those short extra time problems.
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