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FROM THE WORLD FAMOUS ROYAL SHAKESPEARE COMPANY, THE FIRST AUTHORITATIVE,
MODERNIZED, AND CORRECTED EDITION OF SHAKESPEARE’S FIRST FOLIO IN THREE
CENTURIES.

Skillfully assembled by Shakespeare’s fellow actors in 1623, the First Folio was the original Complete
Works. It is arguably the most important literary work in the English language. But starting with Nicholas
Rowe in 1709 and continuing to the present day, Shakespeare editors have mixed Folio and Quarto texts,
gradually corrupting the original Complete Works with errors and conflated textual variations.

Now Jonathan Bate and Eric Rasmussen, two of today’s most accomplished Shakespearean scholars, have
edited the First Folio as a complete book, resulting in a definitive Complete Works for the twenty-first
century.
Combining innovative scholarship with brilliant commentary and textual analysis that emphasizes
performance history and values, this landmark edition will be indispensable to students, theater
professionals, and general readers alike.

For more information on this Modern Library edition, visit www.therscshakespeare.com
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From reader reviews:

Lou Bryant:

The experience that you get from William Shakespeare Complete Works (Modern Library) is a more deep
you searching the information that hide into the words the more you get considering reading it. It does not
mean that this book is hard to be aware of but William Shakespeare Complete Works (Modern Library)
giving you excitement feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point in certain way that can be
understood through anyone who read the idea because the author of this publication is well-known enough.
This book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can go
together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you for having this specific
William Shakespeare Complete Works (Modern Library) instantly.

Amber Payne:

Why? Because this William Shakespeare Complete Works (Modern Library) is an unordinary book that the
inside of the reserve waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will distress you with the secret that inside.
Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who write the book in such awesome way makes the content
interior easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for
you for not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This unique book will give you a lot of
gains than the other book include such as help improving your ability and your critical thinking approach. So
, still want to hesitate having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the book store hurriedly.

Donald Freeman:

This William Shakespeare Complete Works (Modern Library) is great book for you because the content that
is full of information for you who have always deal with world and get to make decision every minute. That
book reveal it facts accurately using great manage word or we can say no rambling sentences included. So if
you are read the idea hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only provides straight
forward sentences but challenging core information with beautiful delivering sentences. Having William
Shakespeare Complete Works (Modern Library) in your hand like having the world in your arm, information
in it is not ridiculous one particular. We can say that no publication that offer you world throughout ten or
fifteen tiny right but this publication already do that. So , it is good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. active do
you still doubt that?

Henry Slaughter:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got college students? We believe that that
problem was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. And
also you know that little person like reading or as looking at become their hobby. You need to understand
that reading is very important and book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to increase you
knowledge, except your teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update regarding something by book.



Numerous books that can you take to be your object. One of them are these claims William Shakespeare
Complete Works (Modern Library).
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