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“Stone Animals” is thick with meaning—psychoanalytically inclined readers can have a field day—yet
resistant to simple interpretation. The story transforms as you look at it, in the same way that Link’s fiction
expertly moves between genres and resists simple forms. - Lincoln Michel, Online Editor, Electric Literaure

About the Author: Kelly Link is the author of the collections Stranger Things Happen, Magic for Beginners,
Pretty Monsters, and Get in Trouble. Her short stories have been published in The Magazine of Fantasy &
Science Fiction, The Best American Short Stories, and Prize Stories: The O. Henry Awards. She has
received a grant from the National Endowment for the Arts. She and Gavin J. Grant have co-edited a number
of anthologies, including multiple volumes of The Year’s Best Fantasy and Horror and, for young adults,
Steampunk! and Monstrous Affections. She is the co-founder of Small Beer Press and co-edits the occasional
zine Lady Churchill’s Rosebud Wristlet. Link was born in Miami, Florida. She currently lives with her
husband and daughter in Northampton, Massachusetts.

About the Publisher: Electric Literature is an independent publisher amplifying the power of storytelling
through digital innovation. Electric Literature’s weekly fiction magazine, Recommended Reading, invites
established authors, indie presses, and literary magazines to recommended great fiction. Once a month we
feature our own recommendation of original, previously unpublished fiction.
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From reader reviews:

Howard Martinez:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Sure, you can
choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to take
a move, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or read a book entitled Stone Animals (Electric
Literature's Recommended Reading)? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You know beside you can
spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree with the
opinion or you have other opinion?

Kimberly Foley:

The book Stone Animals (Electric Literature's Recommended Reading) can give more knowledge and also
the precise product information about everything you want. So why must we leave the great thing like a book
Stone Animals (Electric Literature's Recommended Reading)? A few of you have a different opinion about
reserve. But one aim that will book can give many information for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try
to closer with your book. Knowledge or information that you take for that, you are able to give for each
other; you can share all of these. Book Stone Animals (Electric Literature's Recommended Reading) has
simple shape however, you know: it has great and large function for you. You can search the enormous
world by start and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Randy Caldera:

This Stone Animals (Electric Literature's Recommended Reading) is new way for you who has attention to
look for some information as it relief your hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you upon it getting
knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still having tiny amount of digest in reading this Stone
Animals (Electric Literature's Recommended Reading) can be the light food for you personally because the
information inside this particular book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books build itself in the form
which can be reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-book contact form. People who think that in reserve
form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this publication is the answer. So there isn't any in reading a book
especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't miss the
item! Just read this e-book type for your better life in addition to knowledge.

Virginia Berry:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library or make
summary for some book, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's soul or real their
pastime. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to there but nothing reading
really. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring as well as can't see colorful photos on
there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As we know that on this time,
many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country.



Therefore , this Stone Animals (Electric Literature's Recommended Reading) can make you experience more
interested to read.
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