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Dante Alighieri’s Divine Comedy has, despite its enormous popularity and importance, often stymied readers
with its multitudinous characters, references, and themes. But until the publication in 2007 of Guy Raffa’s
guide to the Inferno, students lacked a suitable resource to help them navigate Dante’s underworld. With this
new guide to the entire Divine Comedy, Raffa provides readers—experts in the Middle Ages and
Renaissance, Dante neophytes, and everyone in between—with a map of the entire poem, from the lowest
circle of Hell to the highest sphere of Paradise.

Based on Raffa’s original research and his many years of teaching the poem to undergraduates, The
CompleteDanteworlds charts a simultaneously geographical and textual journey, canto by canto, region by
region, adhering closely to the path taken by Dante himself through Hell, Purgatory, and Paradise. This
invaluable reference also features study questions, illustrations of the realms, and regional summaries.
Interpreting Dante’s poem and his sources, Raffa fashions detailed entries on each character encountered as
well as on many significant historical, religious, and cultural allusions.
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From reader reviews:

Phyllis Peters:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Sure, you can
choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a stroll,
shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or even read a book titled The Complete Danteworlds: A
Reader's Guide to the Divine Comedy? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You know beside you can
spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with the
opinion or you have some other opinion?

Patrick Cartwright:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside along with friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by reading a book. Ugh, think
reading a book really can hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It all right you can have the
e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like The Complete Danteworlds: A Reader's
Guide to the Divine Comedy which is obtaining the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's
observe.

Eric Sanders:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you might have it in e-
book approach, more simple and reachable. This The Complete Danteworlds: A Reader's Guide to the
Divine Comedy can give you a lot of pals because by you investigating this one book you have issue that
they don't and make an individual more like an interesting person. This book can be one of a step for you to
get success. This publication offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing
more than additional make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? We should have The
Complete Danteworlds: A Reader's Guide to the Divine Comedy.

Elaine Jenkins:

As we know that book is important thing to add our understanding for everything. By a book we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year had
been exactly added. This publication The Complete Danteworlds: A Reader's Guide to the Divine Comedy
was filled regarding science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your technology
competence. Some people has diverse feel when they reading the book. If you know how big selling point of
a book, you can feel enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book that you
wanted.
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